WEST BRADFORD TOWNSHIP CONSORTIUM SALT BID 2023-2024 ESTIMATED NEED:
SODIUM CHLORIDE 19,325 TON; SOLARICE 118 TON; DEICER 1,990 TON

AUGUST 2rd- BIDS DUE @ NOON, OPENING @ 1 PM
AUGUST 8th - BID AWARDED @ 7 PM

COMPANY
ADDRESS
TELEPHONE
FAX

ESTIMATED NEED

OVER ESTIMATED NEED

FOB DELIVERED

FOB DELIVERED

Sodium
Chloride

Solar Deicer Sodium Solar Deicer
Salt Chloride Salt

Sodium
Chloride

Solar Deicer Sodium Solar Deicer
Salt Chloride Salt

Cargill, Inc.

24950 Country Club Blvd.
Suite 450

North Olmsted, OH 44070
Tel: 800-600-7258
salt_customercare@cargill.c
om

No
Bid

No No No No No
Bid Bid Bid Bid Bid

No
Bid

No No No No No
Bid Bid Bid Bid Bid

Chemical Equipment Labs
3920A Providence Rd
Newtown Square, PA
19073

Tel: 610-497-9390
orders@chemical
equpmentlabs.com

$ 79.00

$ 79.00 | $92.00 $79.00 | $79.00 | $92.00

$ 87.00

$87.00 | 100.00 $87.00 | $87.00 | 100.00

Eastern Salt Company

134 Middle Street, Suite 210
Lowell, MA 01852

Tel: 978-251-8553
info@easternsalt.com

$ 74.58

$84.58 | $94.58 | $ 74.58 | $84.58 | $ 94.58

$ 74.58

$84.58 | $94.58 | $74.58 | $84.58 | $ 94.58

Morton Salt

444 W. Lake Street, Suite
3000

Chicago, IL 60606

Tel: 855-665-4450
bids@mortonsalt.com

$81.00

No Bid | $99.00 $81.91 | No Bid | $99.91

TBD
at time
of
request

TBD TBD TBD
at time at time at time

No Bid of of No Bid of
request request request




2023-2024 Consortium Salt Bid Page Two

ESTIMATED NEED OVER ESTIMATED NEED
COMPANY
ADDRESS
TELEPHONE FOB DELIVERED FOB DELIVERED
FAX Sodium Solar Deicer Sodium Solar Deicer Sodium Solar Deicer Sodium Solar Deicer
Chloride Salt Chloride Salt Chloride Salt Chloride Salt
Compass Minerals
9900 W.109" Street No No No No No No No No No No No No
Suite 1000 Bid Bid Bid Bid Bid Bid Bid Bid Bid Bid Bid Bid

Overland Park, KS 66210
Tel: 800-323-1641




	Morton Salt444 W. Lake Street, Suite 3000Chicago, IL  60606

