

**WEST BRADFORD TOWNSHIP CONSORTIUM SALT BID 2018-19 ESTIMATED NEED:
SODIUM CHLORIDE 18,800 TON; SOLAR ICE 310 TON; DEICER 2,895 TON**

**AUGUST 2 - BIDS DUE @ NOON, OPENING @ 1 PM
AUGUST 14 - BID AWARDED @ 8 PM**

COMPANY ADDRESS TELEPHONE FAX	ESTIMATED NEED						OVER ESTIMATED NEED					
	FOB			DELIVERED			FOB			DELIVERED		
	Sodium Chloride	Solar Salt	Deicer	Sodium Chloride	Solar Salt	Deicer	Sodium Chloride	Solar Salt	Deicer	Sodium Chloride	Solar Salt	Deicer
Cargill, Inc. 24950 Country Club Blvd. Suite 450 North Olmsted, OH 44070 Tel: 800-600-7258 Fax: 440-716-0763	\$67.92	No Bid	\$88.32	\$67.92	No Bid	\$88.32	\$77.92	No Bid	\$98.32	\$77.92	No Bid	\$98.32
Chemical Equipment Labs 3920A Providence Rd Newtown Square, PA 19073 Tel: 610-497-9390 Fax: 610-497-9524	\$54.19	\$54.19	\$66.39	\$54.19	\$54.19	\$66.39	\$54.19	\$54.19	\$66.39	\$54.19	\$54.19	\$66.39
Eastern Salt Company 134 Middle Street, Suite 210 Lowell, MA 01852 Tel: 978-251-8553 Fax: 978-251-8244	\$51.00	\$53.00	\$67.00	\$51.00	\$53.00	\$67.00	\$51.00	\$53.00	\$67.00	\$51.00	\$53.00	\$67.00
Morton Salt 444 W. Lake Street, Suite 3000 Chicago, IL 60606 Tel: 855-665-4450 Fax: 630-214-0725	\$53.00	No Bid	\$68.00	\$53.87	No Bid	\$68.87	\$73.00	No Bid	\$88.00	\$73.87	No Bid	\$89.87