
 
COLORCOATING & LINESTRIPING 

BASKETBALL COURTS & HOCKEY RINKS 
SHADYSIDE & BROAD RUN PARKS 

 
Bids Due:  Monday, July 12, 2010   Noon 

Bid Opening:   Monday, July 12, 2010   1:30 PM 
Bids Considered:  Tuesday, July 13, 2010   8:00 PM 

 
 

Bidder 
(Name, Address, Telephone, Fax) 

Basketball 
Court -  

Broad Run 
Park 

Basketball 
Court  -

Shadyside 
Park 

Hockey 
Court - 

Broad Run 
Park 

Hockey 
Court - 

Shadyside 
Park 

Complete 
Project 

 (Lump Sum) 
Total 

Frye’s Athletic Surfaces 
Attn:  Mark Frye 
244 Heilig Road 
Mullica Hill, NJ  08062-2429 
Tel:  856-478-4910 

 
NO BID 

 
NO BID 

 
NO BID 

 
NO BID 

 
NO BID 

H. A. McMaster  
Attn:  Horace A. McMaster, Jr. 
P.O. Box 5006 
Limerick, PA  19468 
Tel:  610-948-6426 
Fax:  610-948-5303 

 
$2,400.00 

 
$3,200.00 

 
$7,500.00 

 
$10,312.00 

 
$23,412.00 

Nickolaus Construction Co., Inc. 
Attn:  Steven D. Nickolaus, Pres. 
P.O. Box 2322 
Vincentown, NJ  08088 
Tel:  609-859-8668   
Fax:  609-859-3674 

 
$4,400.00 

 
$5,200.00 

 
$13,200.00 

 
$15,900.00 

 
$37,600.00 

Pavement Maintenance Cont. Inc. 
Attn:  Joseph F. Ciccone, President 
7916 Beth Bath Pike, Fl. 2 
Bath, PA  18014-8975 
Tel:  610-837-6703 
Fax:  610-837-8554 

 
$4,430.00 

 
$5,485.00 

 
$16,870.00 

 
$19,355.00 

 
$43,620.00 

 


