2010 EQUIPMENT RENTAL - ALL HOURS ‘AS NEEDED’

Bids Due: Monday, May 10,2010 Noon

Bid Opening: Monday, May 10, 2010 2:00 p.m.
Bid Awarded: Tuesday, May 11, 2010 8:00 p.m.

Bidder
(Name, Address, Telephone)

Large
Roller
(12 ton)

Paver
w/Operator
&2
Screedmen

Tri-Axle
Dump
Truck

(79,000 GVW)

Excavator
(320 CL
or
Equivalent)

Dozer
(DC4XL
or
Equivalent)

Skid Steer

w/High Flow
Hydraulics &

Skid
Steer
Attachment —

Skid
Steer
Attachment —

Bucket

Rockhound

Mower

Skid Steer
Attachment —

Skid Steer
Attachment —

Skid Steer
Attachment —

Post Hole
Digger

Windrow
Sweeper

Pickup
Sweeper

CHESTER COUNTY
MILLING & PAVING
Nicholas S. Chilla, Owner
107 Robbins Road
Downingtown, PA 19335
Telephone: 610-269-7325
Fax: 610-873-7370

NO BID

DELAWARE VALLEY

MILLING, INC.

L. Clyde Smith, President
P.O. Box 1358

West Chester, PA 19380

Telephone: 610-696-4232
Fax: 610-356-3689

NO BID

G. ANTONINI CONSTR.
Vincent Antonini, President
3605 Winding Way
Newtown Square, PA 19073
Telephone: 610-356-2264
Fax: 610-356-0725

$95.00

$290.00

$70.00

$125.00

$120.00

$80.00

$25.00

$25.00

$15.00

$25.00

$35.00

S.A. MACANGA, INC.
Steve Macanga, President
919 Camaro Run

West Chester, PA 19380
Telephone: 610-692-5336
Fax: 610-692-4654

$90.00

$200.00

$75.00

$125.00

$90.00

ROBERT R. PEARSON,
INC.

Robert R. Pearson, Pres.
P.O. Box 133

Unionville, PA 19375
Telephone: 610-444-2918
Fax: 610-347-0399

NO BID

JOSEPH E. SUCHER &
SONS

John J. Sucher, COE

1177 E. Ninth Street
Eddystone, PA 19022
Telephone: 610-872-0892
Fax: 610-872-2147

NO BID

WARIHAY ENTERPRISES INC.
Robert Warihay, President

580 N. Colebrook Road

Manheim, PA 17545

Telephone: 717-664-0810

Fax: 717-664-2436

$84.50

$176.00

$75.00

$100.00

$85.00

$50.00

$60.00

$60.00

$50.00

$60.00

$60.00







